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Request for Information. 

 

Thank you for your request received on 10 June in which you asked: 

 

Please could you let me know the cost of  

(i) creating  

(ii) translating and  

(iii) printing the following publication. 

 

http://www.assembly.wales/laid%20documents/cr-ld12487/cr-ld12487-w.pdf 

 

Also, how many copies of this publication have been printed (iv).  

Diolch yn fawr, 

 

Please find the response below: 

 

i) The teams responsible for the production and translation of the 

report are employees of the Assembly Commission and work on a 

variety of tasks and projects. It is not possible to disaggregate their 

costs as staff do not record the time they spend on one element of 

their work, and therefore, this information is not held and cannot be 

provided. 

 

ii) Please see part i) above. 
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iii) The Assembly Commission printed 30 bilingual copies of the report in 

total, at a cost of £68. 

 

iv) Please see part iii) above. 

 

If you would like further information relating to this report or the work of the 

Children, Young People and Education Committee, please contact the 

clerking team at the following address: SeneddCYPE@assembly.wales 

 

 

 

Yours sincerely 

 

 

Freedom of Information Manager  

National Assembly for Wales 
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Your request has been considered according to the principles set out in the 

Code of Practice on Public Access to Information.  If you have any questions 

regarding this response please contact me.  If you feel you have cause for 

complaint, please follow the guidance below. 

 

Cause for concern or complaint with your FOI response? 

 

If you are dissatisfied with the Assembly’s handling of your request, you can 

request an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this 

response.  Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the 

Freedom of Information Manager at:  

Information-request@assembly.wales or in writing to 

The National Assembly for Wales      

Governance and Assurance  

Cardiff Bay 

Cardiff                                                                                                                                                                       

CF99 1NA 

 

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the 

right to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The 

Information Commissioner can be contacted at: 

 

 Information Commissioner’s Office  

 Wycliffe House  

 Water Lane 

 Wilmslow 

 Cheshire 

 SK9 5AF 
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